

4 April 2022

## Prostate Cancer Pharma

Information as available from RISOH (Regional Information system for oncology / haematology)

1. Please provide the total number of patients treated in the last 3 months with any systemic anti-cancer treatment for: **Not available in a RISOH query field so manual check of SACT patient records**

- Prostate cancer (any stage) : **189**
- Metastatic prostate cancer : **160**

2. How many patients were treated for prostate cancer (any stage) in the past 3 months with: **Any ADT information manually collected while check Metastatic status as not available in query field**

- Androgen Deprivation Therapy (ADT) standalone : **Not available from RISOH as not recorded in a specific query field & prescribed by GP**
- Abiraterone (Zytiga) in combination with any ADT : **82**
- Abiraterone (Zytiga) - no ADT : **8**
- Enzalutamide (Xtandi) in combination with any ADT : **68**
- Enzalutamide (Xtandi) - no ADT : **< 5**
- Apalutamide (Erleada) in combination with any ADT : **< 5**
- Darolutamide (Nubeqa) in combination with any ADT : **8**
- Cabazitaxel (Jevtana) : **6**
- Docetaxel in combination with any ADT : **14**
- Docetaxel – no ADT : **0**
- Degarelix (Firmagon): **Not available from RISOH as not recorded in a specific query field and prescribed by GP**
- Olaparib (Lynparza) : **0**

3. How many metastatic prostate cancer patients were treated in the past 3 months with: **Any ADT information manually collected while check Metastatic status as not available in query field**

- Androgen Deprivation Therapy (ADT) standalone : **Not available from RISOH as not recorded in a specific query field & prescribed by GP**
- Apalutamide (Erleada) in combination with any ADT : **< 5**
- Docetaxel in combination with any ADT : **13**
- Docetaxel – no ADT : **0**

### **Please note:**

Use of < 5 (less than five): We are unable to provide an exact figure - exempt from release under section 40(2) of the FOI Act - as this could make patients personally identifiable. Disclosure would constitute a breach of the principles of the General Data Protection Regulations 2018.