

13 July 2022

## **Sexual exploitation of children in residential care**

- 1. How many children in the residential care of your trust were subject to suspected sexual exploitation in each of the last five years?**

01.04.17 – 31.03.18	9
01.04.18 – 31.03.19	6
01.04.19 – 31.03.20	7
01.04.20 – 31.03.21	9
01.04.21 – 31.03.22	12

- 2. How many children in the residential care of your trust were subject to suspected sexual exploitation that led to a criminal prosecution in each of the last five years?**

This information is not held by Belfast Trust

- 3. How many investigations has your trust been involved in, in each of the last five years, regarding alleged sexual exploitation of children in the care of your trust?**

This information is not held by Belfast Trust

- 4. How many children in the foster care of your trust were subject to suspected sexual exploitation in each of the last five years?**

01.04.17 – 31.03.18	< 5
01.04.18 – 31.03.19	< 5
01.04.19 – 31.03.20	< 5
01.04.20 – 31.03.21	< 5
01.04.21 – 31.03.22	< 5

Use of < 5 (less than five): We are unable to provide an exact figure - exempt from release under section 40(2) of the FOI Act - as this could make patients personally identifiable. Disclosure would constitute a breach of the principles of the General Data Protection Regulations 2018.

- 5. How many children in the foster care of your trust were subject to suspected sexual exploitation that led to a criminal prosecution in each of the last five years**

This information is not held by Belfast Trust

13 July 2022