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Primary Care Talking Therapy Hubs 
 
This is a request for information under the Freedom of Information Act for 
information on Primary Care Talking Therapy Hubs.  Please provide the 
following information for 2023/24. 
 
 

1. No of referrals received. 
 

9756 
 
 

2. Average length of waiting time for first treatment appointment (not 
assessment). 
 

The service does not hold the data for wait time for first treatment appointment.  
Belfast Trust offer a Triage Assessment appointment, and then referrals are 
referred on to Community and Voluntary providers for treatment. 

 
 

3. Breakdown of waiting time data, measured from referral received from the 
GP to first appointment, as follows: 

 

i. Less than 1 month  8331 
ii. Longer than 1 month 1420  
iii. Longer than 3 months     <5 
iv. Longer than 6 months     <5 
v. Longer than 12 months       2 

 
Use of <5 (less than five): We are unable to provide an exact figure - exempt 
from release under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act, as the small 
numbers involved could make patients personally identifiable.  Disclosure would 
constitute a breach of the principles of the General Data Protection Regulation 
2018. 

 
 
4. Average number of sessions provided. 
 

6 
 
 
5. Outcomes of treatment recorded. 

 
The service does not hold this data, rather it remains with the individual 
providers contracted to provide treatment. 
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6. Demographic and geographic data. 
 

Distinct Count of Event ID Gender    
Age band F I M Grand Total 

<45 years >5 <5 >5 6326 

45-64 years 1732  1056 2788 

65-74 years 314  134 448 

75+ years 146  48 194 

Grand Total >5 <5 >5 9756 
 

Again, we are unable to provide exact figures - exempt from release under 
Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act, as the small numbers involved 
could make patients personally identifiable.  Given the use of <5 we cannot 
supply figures where >5 is indicated, as totals would allow smaller numbers to be 
discoverable. 

 
 

7. Details of geographic areas in your Trust currently not serviced by the 
PCTT Hubs. 
 

All areas of Belfast Trust are serviced by the Primary Care Talking Therapy 
Hubs. 

 
 
8. Work undertaken to expand the capacity and reach of the PCTT Hubs 

during 2023/24. 
 

The service has applied for elective access funding on two occasions during the 
2023/24 financial year to endeavour to increase the capacity of the PCTT Hub 
provision.  The service was unsuccessful at obtaining any additional funding. 
 
 

9. Spend for 2023/24 
 

£2,311,194.33 
 

10. Budget for 2024/25 
 

£2,394,199.16 
 
 

11. List of providers contracted by the Trust to provide talking therapies. 
 
ASCERT 
BRIDGE OF HOPE/ASHTON 
BALLYNAFEIGH COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT ASSOCIATION 
CANCER LIFELINE 
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COUNSELLING ALL NATIONS 
UPPER SPRINGFIELD DEVELOPMENT TRUST 
NORTH DOWN ENTERPRISES 
LENADOON COUNSELLING 
LIGHTHOUSE 
LOWER ORMEAU RESIDENTS ACTION GROUP (LORAG) 
MINDWISE 
NEW LIFE COUNSELLING 
RELATE NI 
UHUB 
 
 

12. Progress with plans to integrate Talking Therapy Hubs into the Multi-
Disciplinary Team / GP Federation model. 
 
Belfast Trust have been working with other Trusts within the region and with the 
Strategic Planning and Performance Group at the Department of Health to 
devise a draft service specification and agree a plan for the establishment of a 
Regional Talking Therapy Hub model.  This is in line with action 5 of the Mental 
Health Strategy 2021-2031, whereby Primary Care Talking Therapies will be 
managed in hubs, organised at a Federation population level. 
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