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Bullying in Belfast Health Trust 
 
 
1.  How many cases of staff threatening other members of staff have there 
been on the past two years? 

This department does not gather information about “cases of staff threatening other 
members of staff”.   

However, based on the information held and processed by this department, it is 
possible to comment on “reported incidents of Inappropriate/Aggressive Behaviour 
towards Staff by Staff.” 

For the period 01/04/2023 to 31/03/2025 there were 86 reported incidents of 
Inappropriate/Aggressive Behaviour towards Staff by Staff. 

2. How many incidents of staff threatening to neglect patient’s has there been 
in the past two years? 
 
Belfast Trust does not hold this information 
 
3. Of staff involved in any incidents how many are being funded by the trust to 
do their nurse training?  
 
*Belfast Trust does not hold this information 
 

 FOI Code Of Practice Section 16  out of duty of care we wish to advise the 
above information may be available at  foi@qub.ac.uk  
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