

8 July 2026

Transcripts, Notes or Recordings of the Briefing to Media following Publication of the Muckamore Abbey Hospital Inquiry Report

Following the publication of the Muckamore Abbey Hospital Public Inquiry report, journalists attended a briefing/meeting with the Belfast Trust at which questions were asked directly to the Trust's Chief Executive, Jennifer Welsh.

I request the following information:

1. A full transcript, record, or verbatim note of all questions asked by journalists during that meeting/briefing

Under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, the Trust can confirm that it does not hold the information requested.

2. A full transcript, record, or verbatim note of all replies, statements, or answers provided by Jennifer Welsh during the same meeting/briefing

I have attached a link to:

[Belfast Trust Response to the Muckamore Abbey Hospital Inquiry Report
Muckamore Abbey Hospital Inquiry Press Conference](#)

3. If a full transcript does not exist, please provide:

- **Any contemporaneous notes taken by Trust staff**
- **Any internal summaries or write-ups of the meeting**
- **Any audio or video recordings held by the Trust**

Under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, the Trust can confirm that it does not hold the information requested.

For clarity, this request covers any media briefing, press conference, or journalist Q&A session held by the Belfast Trust immediately following the publication of the Muckamore Abbey Hospital report.