

29 July 2026

Muckamore Summit held during 2021

I request copies of all recorded information relating to the Muckamore Summit held during 2021.

This summit was held on 29 April 2021.

Without limiting the scope of this request, I seek:

1. The agenda and programme for the Summit.

Attached.

Note: there is a typographical error on the Agenda. The correct date is 29 April 2021.

2. Minutes of the meeting(s).

Attached.

Note: this document is publicly available on the MAH Inquiry website, having been exhibited to the following statements made to the MAH Inquiry:

- Belfast Trust Corporate Statement Ref: EM06 [6 – Trust statement covering 6a to 6e | Muckamore Abbey Hospital Inquiry](#)
- Dr Cathy Jack's Statement Ref: OM09 [M09 - 03 - Jack, Cathy - Statement \(24.06.14\).pdf](#)

3. Attendance lists and invitations.

The list of attendees and apologies is on the attached Minutes.

This information is not centrally held. To undertake this exercise would necessitate a search of historic email accounts which would require a manual trawl of data which would involve a significant number of hours. This would exceed the costs limit specified in the FOI act.

We estimate that compliance with this (element of the) request for information would exceed the appropriate costs limit. Under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information 2000, the limit has been specified as £450 and represents the estimated cost of one or more persons spending 18 hours in determining whether we hold the information, locating, retrieving and extracting this information.

29 July 2026

4. Presentation slides, briefing papers and reports prepared for or presented at the Summit.

BHSCT presentation attached.

Note: this document is also publicly available on the MAH Inquiry website, having been exhibited to statements made to the MAH Inquiry:

- Belfast Trust Corporate Statement Ref: EM06 [6 – Trust statement covering 6a to 6e | Muckamore Abbey Hospital Inquiry](#)

Other Trusts made presentations but we do not hold a copy of their presentations.

5. Action plans, recommendations and records of decisions arising from the Summit.

This information is not centrally held.

As Qu 3

Any papers submitted by the Belfast Health and Social Care Trust, the Department of Health, the Health and Social Care Board/SPPG, RQIA or any other participating organisation.

Under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, the Trust can confirm that it does not hold the information requested.

6. Any correspondence, including emails, between attendees before and after the Summit concerning its planning, outcomes or implementation.

This information is not centrally held.

As Qu 3

7. Any follow-up reports, progress updates or implementation reviews arising from the Summit.

Under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, the Trust can confirm that it does not hold the information requested.

29 July 2026

8. Any documents referring to lessons learned, governance, safeguarding, quality improvement or service reform discussed at the Summit.

Under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, the Trust can confirm that it does not hold the information requested..

9. Any documents that identify the purpose, objectives or expected outcomes of the Summit.

Please refer to the following publicly available information on the MAH Inquiry website, which appears within statements made to the MAH Inquiry:

- [Dillon, Martin - Statement.pdf](#) – page 100, paragraph 278.
- [M09 - 03 - Jack, Cathy - Statement \(24.06.14\).pdf](#) – page 37, paragraphs 119, 120; page 57, paragraphs 189, 190.