
FOI/29933 
 

10 October 2023 

 

Contact: publicliaison@belfasttrust.hscni.net         Page 1 of 1 

 

 
 
Extremely and very preterm births and deaths 
 
 
1.  For the year 2022/23, please provide information showing the number of 
preterm births that were: 
 
i.  Extremely preterm (before 28 weeks); and 
 
ii.  Very preterm (between 28 and 32 weeks). 
 
2.  Disclose the number of births in each category that was planned. 
 
3.  Disclose the number of babies in each category not recorded as having 
died. 
 

Infants Born RJMS  
1 April 2022 – 31 March 2023 

Births Total Births 
Planned 

Babies Not 
Recorded as 
having Died 

i. Extremely preterm (before 28 
weeks); and 

45 31 23 

    

ii. Very preterm (between 28 
and 32 weeks). 28 – 31 + 6 
weeks 

58 35 56 

    

 
 
4.  Please disclose any high level documents you may have relating to the 
costs associated with extremely preterm births for the year 2022/23.  
 
We do not hold these documents. 
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